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BRIDGE TALE! 
By Dan Barton, Publisher 

 

     Our Harmony Way Bridge was 85 
years young on December 26, 2015. No 
celebration, no fireworks, no happy 
Harmonists dancing in the street. Bear-
ing silent witness to the passage of time 
in our fair town, it stands in mute testi-
mony to the failure of more modern 
society’s inability to modestly imitate 
this achievement of generations past.  
     But there is good news of a sort. 
Part of the $84 million dollars allocated 
by Governor Mike Pence’s, “Regional 
Cities,” economic initiative has found 
its way to New Harmony and some of 
that money may go to the Harmony 
Way Bridge. Southwest Indiana has 
been designated as one of the three re-
gions in our State to benefit from this 
initiative. This region will receive $42 
million dollars and New Harmony will 
get $500,000 of that portion, as has 
been reported from Indianapolis. 
     Four projects have been highlighted 
as recipients of this grant: 1) The WMI, 
Maclure Conservatory, Farm toTable 
program will be receiving $150,000 for 
reuse of the abandoned New Harmony 
School. 2) The Odd Fellows Hall lo-
cated at Tavern and Main Street is 
slated to get $107,500. 3) Maclure 
Square at Church and Main will receive 
$147,500 and be turned intoThe Main 
Street Extended Market & Pavilion. 
And number 4) The Harmony Way 
Bridge has been granted $95,000.  
     Many people here in New Harmony 
have been instrumental in the success 
of our Town’s being able to receive this 
money. Way too many to be mentioned 
in this article and this small paper, at 
this time. Surely the success that our 
friends and neighbors have achieved so 
far, has it’s own rewards. 
     The New Harmony Gazette will 
publish short articles over the next four 
month’s relating to each of the four 
programs that are being funded. We 

will start with the plan that received the 
smallest allocation of State money. Us-
ing the old rule, “putting the least first,” 
we begin with the Harmony Way Pe-
destrian Bridge Project. 
     Jim Spann, owner of the New Har-
mony Soap Company and current presi-
dent of the New Harmony Business 
Associates, has been in the forefront of 
the idea to reuse The Harmony Way 
Bridge as a Park, Bikeway, Hike-Way 
and Cart-Path since the inception of the 
idea.  
     Jim first mentioned and circulated 
literature about using the bridge for 
recreational and tourism purposes more 
than a year ago.  The idea seemed to 
catch on. Previously, Committees and 
Civic Groups were formed to rehabili-
tate and reopen it as a public thorough-
fare but this approach ran into obstacles 
at both the State and Local government 
levels, so Jim has changed the mix to 
something that seems to be more popu-
lar.  
     By adopting this new Park/Bridge 
approach an immediate financial re-
ward has been gleaned. The $95,000 is 
a match grant funding and money will 
have to be raised dollar for dollar be-
fore the funds can be used. It was an-
nounced that the first use of the money 
could be to provide for inspections and 
see how much work must be done to 
reopen the bridge for the public and a 
study to determine exactly how it can 
be used to pay its way and insure suc-
cess. In using the Park/Bridge concept, 
the Harmony Way Bridge may also be 
eligible for other types of funding 
through other State and Federal agen-
cies. Both Evansville and Mt. Vernon 
received several million dollars from 
Indiana State Department of Natural 
Resources to build a similar type of 
Park, Bike, Hike-Way.  
     There are also many people who 
live and work in New Harmony who 
would like to see the Bridge returned to 

it’s former glory as a public thorough-
fare, but have been disappointed time 
and time again by the timidity of our 
elected officials and their inability to do 
what Roy Clippinger and his Executive 
Committee did in 1930 when they built 
the Harmony Way Bridge. You can bet 
that $550,000 dollars was a lot of 
money in those days but the men who 
made up that bridge committee had the 
imagination and wherewithal to see it 
through.  
     In the depths of the Depression they 
built a functional piece of architectural 
art that still rivals any bridge in Indiana 
for its beauty and length. 
     Now the main concerns for the Park/
Bridge are whether or not the matching 
funds can be raised and if the Park/
Bridge idea can generate the income to 
take care of maintenance and pay the 
liability insurance costs. Also, what 
entity can receive the State funds that 
are being allocated. 
     The White County Bridge Commis-
sion decided to close the Harmony Way 
Bridge in 2012 for perceived safety 
concerns after inspection reports indi-
cated that some areas of the bridge had 
a loss of structural capacity. Since then 
several studies and inspections have 
been conducted by various state offi-
cials and bridge engineers. These have 
indicated that the bridge is in need of 
repair and continued maintenance to 
improve its present condition. 
     The inspections pointed out that 
some elements of the bridge should 
eventually be replaced or repaired, such 
as the road bed, the expansion joints, 
the side railings, new metal deck drains 
and cleaning and painting to allow the 
bridge to be brought back as a public 
thoroughfare. There are those who 
would like the thoroughfare option re-
turned. That story also needs considera-
tion. Particularly since new data is al-
ways coming out about what took place 
at the time and shortly after the bridge 
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JAKE WARRUM FOR JUDGE 
-  AT KIWANIS MEETING 

APRIL 9, 2018 
by: Dan Barton, Publisher

 What follows are excerpts of a 
speech given by Posey County Indiana 
Circuit Court candidate for Judge, Jake 
Warrum, at an April New Harmony 
Kiwanis meeting:
 This is the first opening that the Posey 
County Circuit Court has seen since 
1983. So we are in for a big change and 
the change is coming, whether any of us 
wants to see change of not.
 Judge Redwine has officially not filed, 
so there will be a new Circuit Court 
Judge.  I made my announcement public 
in November for my intentions to run.  
And a fellow Democrat got in as well.  So 
we’ll be duking it out in the Primaries. 
 A little bit about me.  I was born 
and grew up in St. Wendall, went to St. 
Wendall Catholic School and in the 6th 
grade went on to North Posey Junior 
High and High School.  I was on the 
semi- state Football Team in the mid 90s.  
Then on to Hanover College (Indiana) 
and participated in two sports.  
 Then a Judge from South Carolina, 
who we were friends with, actually 
talked me into going to law school.  
He gave me the best advice probably 
anybody gave me, “Go to law school 
where you can wear a swimsuit year 
round.”(Lots of laughs from the crowd)  
So I spent the next four and a half years 
out in San Diego.   I spent four years in 
the sunshine having fun in southern 
California.  Then I moved back home.  I 
made that choice back in 2005.  I started 
an office in Evansville and worked 
primarily in the Vanderburgh and Posey 
County Courts.  I would occasionally go 
to Warrick County or Gibson County.
 One of the memories I have was as a 
young lawyer when I met U.S. District 

Court Judge Young in Evansville.  I was 
just fresh out of law school and he says 
to me, “You’re not ready to work here.”  
But within 30 days the U.S. government 
chose to charge 36 people in a federal 
drug conspiracy indictment.  We didn’t 
have enough lawyers. I got a phone call 
and practiced in that Court and have 
been working ever since.
 That’s why I practice not only in the 
Posey County Courts and Vanderburgh 
County Courts but also about 35% in the 
Federal Courts.   So I work here and in 
Evansville, Terre Haute, New Albany and 
Indianapolis.   Occasionally I get over to 
Owensboro if they are short.  Every now 
and then I have to run over to Benton, 
Illinois and work in that District.
 Trial-wise experience - I stopped 
keeping count after about twenty.  But 
I can tell you, somewhere between 75 
and 85 jury trials in the last 14 years.  
Three of those have been Civil, which is 
absolutely unheard of now.   No one tries 
a Civil jury trial anymore.   Alternate 
dispute resolution has forced almost 
every Civil case to get resolved in pre-
trial.   The remaining ones have been 
criminal in nature.
 Posey County is facing some pretty 
significant issues.   House Bill 1006 was 
passed 3 or 4 years ago and we’re keeping 
all of our low level criminals here in the 
county.
The new jail has been one of the biggest 
benefits we’ve seen because the jail’s 
going to end up paying for itself in a very 
short time.
 I’m working with U.S. Marshal Brian 
Tilson and Sheriff Oeth trying to get a 
federal contract in place.   Then we can 
start housing federal inmates at our local 
jail.  A lot of people would say why would 
we want to do that?  About 25 years ago 
Vanderburgh County and the federal 
government got into a fight and they 
pulled the federal inmates and they’ve 
been housing them in Henderson since.   

They actually house some of them right 
over here in White County.  They house 
them in Knox County.  They Pay $47.50 
per day, per inmate.   It costs about $5.80 
to feed one.   That means the County is 
pulling in $42 per day, per inmate.   Those 
are issues that we have to be cognizant of.   
Look at Vanderburgh county.  They are 
currently housing roughly 150 inmates 
outside of Vanderburgh County.
 One of the things I spoke to Mt. 
Vernon about was that the Circuit Court 
scheduling needs to be checked.  I have 
somebody who needs to be sentenced 
now, and I can’t get a sentencing date 
until the end of May.  So, if I could 
sentence him tomorrow then we could 
get $25 dollars a day from the State, 
from now till the end of May.  I think 
everybody in here would take $25 dollars 
a day from now till the end of May.  Why 
can’t I get the case into Court?   
 I’ve met with Mr. Clowers (County 
Prosecutor) a number of times to have 
court everyday.  We have the beautiful 
(Court) Building, let’s use it.
 The CHINS court is the next step.
(Children In Need of Services) That 
needs a lot of change.
 When I came back (to Posey County) 
in ’05 there were three family case 
managers working in all of Posey 
County.  We are up to 16 now in 14 years.   
The CHINS numbers have exploded.  
From the State’s standpoint they have 
poured gasoline on a hot fire.
Members of the Department of 
Family and Children Services have 
independently sued the department 
saying that they’ve been overworked; 
and they have.
 So the State has put all of this 
money into the department and hired 
all of these new people to get into the 
guidelines.     They haven’t added any 
judges, they haven’t added any lawyers.   
So we have all of these case managers 
and we are trying to manage a calendar 
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closed. 
     So far a lot of the cost estimates to 
bring the bridge back to life as a road-
way for vehicles has been more than 
the States of Illinois and Indiana are 
willing to accept. But after speaking to 
some of the people who have been in-
volved in the bridge inspections and 
reading several of the inspection re-
ports, the Gazette has learned some 
interesting facts, which do not seem to 
have been considered by anyone with 
the responsibility to reopen the bridge. 
     Not all of the inspectors agree that 
the bridge would cost millions to reha-
bilitate for use as an “automobile only” 
bridge. As little as $100,000 or less 
could have brought the bridge back up 
to usable standards within a month of 
its closing, according to one consultant. 
Still could! The balance of the work 
would then have to be done incremen-
tally over time. A little at a time, and 
paid for by the usual collection of tolls. 
Approximately a thousand vehicles 
were using the bridge daily when it 
closed. That’s well over $300,000 a 
year in revenue. Using automatic toll 
machines and controlling labor costs 
would save the operational funds 
needed to continue using the bridge as 
it was designed for originally, I was 
told. 
     One Engineering Company listed 
five options for rehabilitation of the 
bridge in their 2007 report. Structure-
point, Inc. stated some of the options, 
Option #1, that the bridge could be 
maintained “as is” with annual mainte-
nance. Limit traffic to passenger cars 
and light pickup trucks and after 10 
years, convert the bridge to a pedestrian 
bridge. They listed Option 5, “The 
Scaled Back Option” that would give 
the bridge many more years of useful 
life by removing truck traffic, patching 
the current deck, replacing the expan-
sion joints, placing a membrane over 
the patched deck and overlay it with 2 
inches of asphalt, install metal deck 
drains and a new three tier bridge rail-
ing system for $1,002,000 of estimated 
costs. The highest rehab figure that 
they posted was for a much more ex-
tensive repair and would cost 
$7,332,000. All of this information is 
known to the White County Bridge 

Commission and should be known to 
every elected and appointed govern-
ment official that has been involved in 
this debacle, but none have been able to 
move. Where is Roy Clippinger when 
you need him? 
     As far as fracture critical inspections 
go, though I have heard a figure of 
around $155,000, I have also been ad-
vised by one highly regarded bridge 
engineer that he will do a complete 
fracture critical inspection for far less 
than $100,000. In fact, in 2012 one 
company offered the Bridge Commis-
sioners the opportunity to have an in-
spection done for $38,000. What’s go-
ing on here? The Gazette has been at-
tempting to reach one of the Bridge 
Commissioners, Mike Egbert, but has 
yet to receive a call back. Hopefully he 
can clear all of this up. 
     When Karen Walker was a New 
Harmony Councilwoman she said that 
she was concerned about the Town’s 
Gas Line and wanted to insure the con-
tinued delivery of Natural Gas to New 
Harmony by removing the line from the 
bridge. The most cost effective way 
that that Council could find to remove 
the line and then sink it under the Wa-
bash would cost from $777,700 
dollars to an un-guaranteed cost of 
$1.28 million. All contracts of this na-
ture have a “Rock Clause” in them, 
which provides for the possibility of 
hitting rock in the drilling procedure. 
Such an incident will drive costs sky-
ward.  
     These costs are to be financed by a 
loan and paid off through town resi-
dents’ gas rates, which are already 
higher than Evansville’s. A couple of 
loan calculations show that the base 
rate of natural gas utility bills could go 
up by $30 to $35 dollars per month. 
How can new families be attracted to 
our town when we offer them exorbi-
tant gas rates? 
     “My Opinion? Bah Humbug!” Of 
the several bridge experts that I have 
talked to none of them were concerned 
about the bridge falling down anywhere 
within the next 100 to 200 years and it 
could more than adequately hold up a 
gas line over that period. So what’s the 
big rush Town Council? 
     Wouldn’t it be cheaper just to buy 

the bridge for a dollar, spend $100,000 
dollars to get it rolling again and incre-
mentally repaired, so that tolls could be 
collected and then used to maintain it 
and pay the $10,000 annual insurance 
premiums? Sure it would! It’s what 
Roy Clippinger would do! 
     In Dr. James Cooper’s book, “Iron 
Monuments to Distant Posterity,” he 
quotes Bridge Engineer Gustav Linden-
thal, from 1924, “…this glorious age of 
iron …will leave few if any durable 
iron monuments to distant posterity… 
Among them should surely be, if possi-
ble, substantial iron bridges that could 
be made to last several thousand years, 
if properly cared for in countries with 
stable civilizations. But who can look 
that far into the future?” We Can! We 
are there! Are we stable yet? 
     Our bridge, “The Harmony Way 
Bridge,” is listed as one of the ten most 
endangered bridges in Indiana. It is on 
the National Register of Historic Places 
and is the longest Parker Through Truss 
bridge in our State. There are less than 
twenty still in existence in Indiana. 
 

 
GHOST BRIDGE: 

THE HARMONY WAY 
By Angelia Phillips 

 
     For decades she spanned the Wa-
bash River as the largest bridge of her 
type in the State of Indiana. She was 
beautiful, with four spans of gleaming 
iron and cable. Local folks manned the 
booths, greeting her users and accept-
ing the coinage for too required to cross 
her. 
     Although I’m not a native Hoosier, 
most of my growing up years were 
spent here in the rivers land, in Posey 
and Gibson counties. Being a Pumpkin 
Runner I spent lots of time and have a 
good bit of wonderful memories of 
time spent in beautiful New Harmony 
where many a family and church picnic 
took place in Murphy Park. The Har-
mony Way was the first toll bridge I 
ever remember crossing. She was 
probably the first toll bridge my mother 
and grandmother ever crossed too. My 
gran was born in the 1920s and my 
mother in 1943. The Harmony Way 
was built in 1930. 

where we have court once every other 
week.  You need to have two Criminal 
Court sessions per week. You need to 
have two CHINS Court sessions per 
week.
 So what do you need to know about 
me?   What and why should I be the 
person you check the Box for on May 8th.  
Those who know me know I’m a closet 
workaholic.  It’s what I thrive on.  I start 
about 6:30 every morning with a pot of 
coffee.  I’m in front of my computer by 
seven and there’s a lot of days I don’t stop 
until six or seven o’clock at night.
 That’s what we need.  We need 
somebody who’s going to get in there 
and work.  We haven’t tried a jury trial 
in Posey County in over two and a half 
years.   Why?     How many of you have 
been called for jury duty in the past two 
and a half years?  (No one!)
Why aren’t we trying cases?  Are we 
pleading everything out?  Is it due to the 
court not being available?  Is it turning 
into time served?   Those are questions 
we need to be asking.   Vanderburgh 
County has tried 17 cases this year 
(2018).  We haven’t tried a jury trial in 
Circuit Court in two and a half years.    
 The Civil docket really doesn’t need 
a great deal of work.  It is functioning 
pretty good.  The Domestic Relations 
docket - you cant get a hearing.  I have 
a divorce case right now and it’s looking 
at August.   That’s a long way off.  That 
means we’ve already had a pre-trial and 
we’ve already had mediation that failed.  
But no hearing date until August.
 The issue I see and the issue that I 
think the county should see, is that the 
next person that goes in there needs to 
be somebody that’s going to take both 
reins and just put their nose to the 
grindstone.  It’s going to take a lot of 
work to get through the backlog. There’s 
a pretty significant backlog.  
 The other thing we need to do; we 
have these statistics now that are saying 
punishment is very good, especially 
in the cases that need it.  But there are 
so many cases that if we don’t start the 
rehabilitation cycle - whether it be by 
creating a drug court, where there are 
more grants for them than any other 
program in the State right now.  We have 

community Christian programs without 
any sanctioning power.  They have to get 
warrants.
 Why is it a probation officer can be 
in charge of someone who is under the 
influence of methamphetamine but 
doesn’t have the power to take them to 
jail.   The Officer has to go get a warrant.   
So that let’s the person leave and get in 
their car and if they run over a small 
child, who’s responsible?  There’s a 
problem there.  Those folks need to get 
immediate sanctions.
 This morning I started about 7 a.m. 
- grabbed my stuff from the office and 
went to morning court - got out of 
morning court later - had a ministry 
team meeting at church and then went 
to afternoon court until after four p.m.  
I dropped my stuff and immediately 
came over here.   So now you’ve got an 
introduction.  At most of the places 
that I’ve spoken there have been many 
questions, because this is probably 
the biggest change we have seen in the 
county for a number of years.  

So, any questions?      General Question - 
What is CHINS?   

 JakeWarrum - Child in Need of 
Services.   Indiana Department of Family 
and Children Services.   If you have a 
mother and a father who get arrested 
who have a persistent drug use problem 
and who have a persistent domestic 
violence problem - anytime the State of 
Indiana has to go in and remove a child 
from a home.  We have roughly 278 
children in the system now.  That’s just 
in Posey County alone.  That’s a scary 
number!  I have a CHINS case that’s 
three and half years old and has no end 
in sight.  Whether it be with the mother 
or the father or whether it be adoption.  
It’s a really tough area of the law.  
 DanBarton - How many inmates will 
the new jail hold - with the additions?                               
JakeWarrum - In total, max capacity within 
the State guidelines is 80% of 252.  252 
is max capacity.  But I don’t know - the 
State says you are only supposed stay at 
80%.  Because in cities like Indianapolis 
you can have 50 - 75 person swings on 
the weekend.  We don’t get those kind of 

swings in Posey County.  We get a swing 
of 2 or 3 people on the weekend.  
They were really smart when they built 
the new jail as big as they did.   The new 
jail has 80 to 90 beds for local inmates.  
The rest of the beds will be farmed out.  
 DanBarton - How many do you think 
will be federal?
 JakeWarrum - We are just starting 
that process.  We don’t yet qualify.  Has 
anyone seen the new jail?    It’s being 
built in two phases.  The first phase is 
for housing inmates and second phase 
now going on is the administrative 
building.  So we don’t qualify for federal 
inmates yet, because we don’t have a 
working kitchen.  That is in the present 
building phase and they are doing a 
really nice job maintaining through the 
four month period that everybody knew 
would be a nightmare.   Marshal Tilson, 
Sheriff Oeth and I are trying to get the 
paperwork filled out correctly.  That way 
when the jail is full operational we can 
set standards.
 DanBarton - I was looking at the 
numbers and it was $16 million dollars 
for the addition.
 JakeWarrum - I thought it was $14.8, 
right now around $15 million dollars is 
close.  If you’re housing a 100 inmates 
even at  $25 dollars per day, per inmate, 
it makes a pretty good dent in it.  
 DanBarton - The reason I’m thinking 
that you have so few jury trials - criminal 
jury trials - very few - So that means 
there’s a lot of plea bargaining going on, 
right?
 JakeWarrum - There’s a certain 
amount.
 DanBarton- Pleading down their 
cases?
 JakeWarrum - Posey County doesn’t 
plead down as much as other counties 
I’ve worked in.  You don’t normally see 
a lead charge plea.  I’d say Mr. Clowers 
and Mr. Parkhurst do a nice job getting 
their charges.  They are not over doing 
by asking for too much.
 CharlieGaston - Why is there such a 
backlog?
 JakeWarrum - Criminal Court is 
scheduled once a week by the Judge.  
It could be set at two times a week.  It 
needs to happen more often.  One of the 
things that we see is called the “Cattle 
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     She was more than just a beautiful 
bridge and a marvel of engineering. 
She’s one of those fine old structures 
built with muscle, seat, shovels, ham-
mers, with wagons hauling equipment 
and parts pulled by horses and mules. 
     She was more than a convenience. 
She was a guarantee of commerce. It 
was her that kept the historically sig-
nificant village of New Harmony easily 
accessible to tourists and regular clients 
from across the river, especially in ar-
eas like Carmi and Crossville and 
Grayville, Illinois. 
     Currently Harmony Way is listed in 
the top ten of Indiana’s most endan-
gered historical landmarks. In 2013 
Harmony Way was closed due to dete-
riorated structural integrity. I was im-
pressed to learn that the old girl’s trou-
ble isn’t with her original parts but 
rather in areas that were augmented in 
later years by the U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers. That’s not to knock the 
engineers. It just is what it is and they 
had good intentions. The augmenta-
tions and additions were made in effort 
to help the structure better manage the 
changes in the Wabash River. 
     There are locals who are adamant 
about Harmony Way remaining closed. 
The amount of money to have her in-
spected by a qualified engineer is huge. 
The considerable amounts to have her 
either brought up to standard as a heavy
-load bearing bridge, or even to tear her 
down climbs from an estimate, given 
by Structure Point Engineering in 2007, 
at $7.5 million or to tear her down and 
re-build a new bridge at $26 million 
estimated by Indiana Department of 
Transportation. 
     But, there are others who’ve been 
passionate about saving her and the 
ideas for doing that are worthy of con-
sideration, and could offer opportuni-
ties to not only keep her open and 
working, but in the doing so help to pay 
for her repair and future upkeep as 
well. That added to helping breath back 
some life into the business sector of 
New Harmony. Business owners I’ve 
spoken with personally, have stated 
revenue has markedly declined since 
the Harmony Way closure. 
     Now to get to New Harmony, folks 
have to travel a good clip out of their 

way in either direction to gain access to 
the Illinois-side of the Wabash, riding 
through remote, country roads. The 
lack of bridge access seems to have had 
an impact on the number of tourists 
who used to come to visit places such 
as the Workingmen’s Institute Museum 
& Library, the Roofless Church, the 
Harmonist Labyrinth, the Athenaeum, 
West Street Log Cabins, Lenz House & 
Garden, Community Houses, Rapp 
Granary, Art Galleries, and indie biz 
shops producing fine goods from indie 
craftsmen and artists. 
     Just a few minutes from New Har-
mony limits are two frequented areas 
for locals and out of town tourists. One 
is Old Dam, another area spot of his-
torical significance that’s also a popular 
spot for public fishing and camping. A 
bit further up the road is Harmonie 
State Park, which has cabins, camping, 
fishing and swimming areas. It’s a very 
popular area for horseback riding and 
hiking, and it’s single-track off-road 
cycling trails make it one of the best 
mountain biking areas in the whole 
Midwest with trails for beginners, inter-
mediates and advanced riders to enjoy. 
     But, for all its awesomeness, neither 
of these places have access to a nearby 
country store, camp shop or grocer. 
There are no cycle repair shops in the 
area. New Harmony has two gas sta-
tions and some excellent eating estab-
lishments but poor accessibility may be 
keeping guests away and also having an 
impact on the other side of the river in 
areas like Carmi, Crossville and 
Grayville, Illinois. 
     On the bright side, there are options 
worth considering that might help re-
store and increase the number of visi-
tors to New Harmony, but use of the 
bridge is a key aspect in several of 
them. 
     The price for heavy-weight repairs 
is high, but it should be much less to 
bring her up to standard to tolerate light 
traffic, such as pedestrians, cyclist, 
ATV’s and golf carts. The bridge is 
wide enough to even provide space for 
vendors’ stands along her sides and 
there’s room at both entrances for those 
as well. Both sides of the Wabash there 
offer spectacular scenery for viewing 
and photo ops. 

     From both a personal and profes-
sional perspective, I sincerely hope her 
closure is temporary. I’d hate to see 
New Harmony, in the long term, de-
cline like other nearby towns in Posey 
County which have become mere shad-
ows of the thriving communities they 
used to be, like Upper Hills, Griffin and 
Stewartsville. 
     It’s something to think about as 
small town America keeps going the 
way of the dinosaur. 
     God bless you, thanks for the read 
and please don’t forget to thank a vet-
eran at you next opportunity. 
 

 
Resolutions, With Help 

By Ann Rains 
 

     New Year’s Resolutions! How did a 
tradition that dooms so many of us to 
failure come into being? 
     The Romans get a lot of credit with 
Janus, a mythical king who could look 
backwards and forwards into the new 
year at the same time since he had two 
faces.  Sometime around 153 B.C. 
Janus became a symbol for resolutions 
and the first month of the year is named 
for him.  But other sources say that 
New Year’s resolutions were started 
long before that. Four thousand years 
ago, the Babylonians celebrated the 
new year in the springtime when new 
crops were planted. Their resolutions 
were mainly to return borrowed 
tools.  What a thoughtful resolution! 
New Years may be the oldest holiday 
celebrated by mankind but it’s age cer-
tainly never gave me strength to adhere 
to any of the resolutions I made as a 
young woman.  With an abysmal track 
record for breaking New Year’s resolu-
tions, I decided I was now too mature 
to attempt this childish endeavor. 
     Then, a revelation came to me.  It 
was while studying Ross and Steven-
son’s Bible interpretation book series 
that this occurred.  Paul’s letter to the 
Romans illuminates the effect of our 
choices. Paul tells us that God gives us 
our own way and our choices effect all 
of creation. Paul also states that if our 
choice is sinful, God’s wrath occurs. 
(Romans 1) 
     My thoughts, after reading this 
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Call” day.  That’s really what it is.  It’s 
40 to 50 cases off the docket in one day.  
They do one after another and it’s awful.  
Anybody who’s been to Criminal Court 
and sat through that knows what I mean.  
It’s terribly inefficient .  You need to be 
able to set ten a day.  If you set ten then 
it runs smooth.  Each one runs about 40 
minutes.  Right now over the next 120 
days the courts will be unavailable for 60 
of the next 120.  
 General Question - When you went 
today did you have to sit through all of 
this before your case could be called?
 JakeWarrum -  I had four cases on the 
calendar this morning, that’s four out of 
thirty.   It’s infuriating.  The other day 
I did some calculations.   There were 14 
lawyers in court just sitting.  Thirteen of 
which were appointed by the court and 
paid by the public.  Court started 40 
minutes late.  And we all just sat there.   
When I sit in court I’m getting paid for 
my time just like everyone else.  We need 
to have Criminal Court at least 2 or 3 
times a week.  We need to have CHINS 
Court 2 or 3 times a week.
 GeneralQuestion - Is there the 
infrastructure to do that?
 JakeWarrum - I will tell you that the 
infrastructure would be screaming and 
shouting, “Thank You!”  But I wouldn’t 
say they sit around doing nothing.   They 
are in the same boat as all of us.  They’d 
much rather do 5 or 6 a day than do 40 in 
an afternoon.   It makes their job much 
harder.  The infrastructure is there.  
 The only infrastructure problem is 
that we’re having trouble on the days that 
we have 40 to 45  cases set.  Transporting 
to and from the jail.  Because the jail 
transport officer has to come up, wait for 
those people to be called, then go back 
and then bring the next set up.  And then 
go back again.  The new jail will have the 
capability of SKYPE and that will help.  
The Supreme Court has said that that 
is an acceptable manner to hold certain 
hearings.  There are certain hearings 
where people must be in person.  But for 
70% you can do by video.  The new jail 
will have that technology.
 It’s my understanding that they are 
going to ask for a magistrate to help 
with the CHINS cases.  A magistrate 

is a non-elected judge.   It’s somebody 
who gets appointed.  Warrick County 
has been given a magistrate.  There is 
not a magistrate in Gibson County.  
Vanderburgh County has seven 
magistrates.
 My concern is, why are we going 
to ask the Supreme Court to give us a 
magistrate and then have to go to the 
County Commissioners and say we need 
$100 thousand plus dollars to pay this 
magistrate when the court’s not going to 
work 60 out of 120 days.  Now, I’m all for 
getting a magistrate because you never 
turn away help.  But it seems like we’re 
cutting our nose off to spite our face.   
We’re spending money on something 
that could be fixed with a little bit of 
elbow grease.
 Remember to vote in the primary 
on May 8th.  The last time we had an 
election in our district, 7000 voters cast 
ballots.  That was because it was also a 
Presidential primary.   The time before 
that one was a mid term, like now, and 
only 1100 voters turned out.   Don’t 
forget to vote on or before May 8th.  

OUR ENDANGERED 
ATMOSPHERE!

by: Ann Rains, Writer, Editor  Written 
March 2018

 As I stared out the window at the 
dazzling sunlight, my mind began 
listing the outside work I hoped to 
accomplish this Spring-like day even 
though the vernal equinox was more 
than two weeks in the future.  Cut the 
tall naked flower stalks with their seed 
pod heads.  These had been left for the 
birds to glean during the winter.  Trim 
the herbs in the kitchen herb garden—
especially sage which had grown into a 
large bush.  Transplant.  Weed. So much 
to do!
 The dogs were clambering to be put 
outside during this musing.  When I 
opened the back door to release them 
into the yard, an overwhelmingly 
unpleasant odor assaulted my olfactory 
glands.  I pulled my head back inside the 
door with the prompt decision to delay 
garden duties.  Still I was concerned 

about leaving my animals outside 
breathing this odoriferous soup.  Since 
the few breaths I took left a chemical 
taste in my mouth, I knew that the 
air was densely polluted with minute 
particulate matter.
 It wasn’t the first time I noticed the 
poor air quality in our community.  My 
friends and relatives have told me stories 
about it.  A relative mentioned that she 
left her bedroom window open one 
balmy night.  When she awakened, the 
taste in her mouth was terrible and the 
air flowing in through the window stank 
of chemicals.  Another friend states 
that each time he enters Mt. Vernon he 
wonders if his car is malfunctioning due 
to the smell.
 Particulate matter (PM), 10 
micrometers or less, can reach deep into 
your lungs and consequently, into your 
blood stream.  Inhaling PM can cause 
a multitude of serous health problems.  
Asthma, irregular heart beat, heart 
attacks, cancer, pre-mature deaths and 
other ailments are a result of breathing 
PM.
 I do not know from whence cometh 
the stench.  There are five large industries 
in our community and another being 
built soon.  It is a wonder that industries 
do not understand that keeping the 
air clean supports their employees, 
helping to keep health insurance costs 
down.  Many employers pay for health 
insurance.  Perhaps installing filters to 
capture this chemical stew is not done 
due to financial costs.  But it is corporate 
malfeasance.  The EPA, in the Clean Air 
Act, requires “the maximum degree of 
reduction in emissions of hazardous air 
pollutants.”
 It is not only Mt. Vernon but other 
communities as well.  Indiana is the sixth 
leading air polluter in the United States.  
In a USA Today article, Sept. 26, 2016, 
Evansville was called a Super Polluter 
due to the proximity of four coal-fired 
power plants.  All towns within 30 miles 
of these power plants were listed as air 
quality endangered.  However, most of 
the time the wind blows from the west 
and south keeping Mt. Vernon free from 
unneeded additional amounts of sulfur 
and nitrogen dioxides which is also 
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scripture, were not to make a New 
Year’s resolution per se, but to change 
my approach toward making them. The 
most important question I had was, 
“What can be done to help preserve 
God’s creation?” which includes you 
and me as well as our planet Earth.   
The motto of the Daughter’s of the 
King, a faith-based Episcopal women’s 
group, seems to hold the answer. For 
His sake… “I am but one, but I am one. 
I cannot do everything, but I can do 
something. What I can do, I ought to 
do.  What I ought to do, by the grace of 
God, I will do.  Lord, what will you 
have me do? Amen.” 
     This beautiful and simple prayer 
says it all.  “I cannot do everything, but 
I can do something.” And the vital 
question, “Lord, what will you have me 
do?” This  gives our resolution depth—
a faith based approach to making New 
Year’s resolutions! 
     As Christians who care about one 
another, we are often placed in difficult 
situations. Sometimes the only avenue 
left to take when trying to make a dif-
ference in ending war or helping others 
understand the drastic environmental 
changes ahead is through prayer and 
writing. 
     Always, there have been environ-
mentally friendly people. “Already the 
planet is so damaged and the future is 
so challenged by its rising human popu-
lation that the terms of survival will be 
severe beyond anything we have 
known in the past,” writes Thomas 
Berry, ordained Roman Catholic priest, 
historian and author of “The Dream of 
the Earth,” 1988. 

     Fifty-seven years ago, Albert Ein-
stein said, “We shall require a substan-
tially new manner of thinking if man-
kind is to survive.” Two thousand years 
ago, Paul wrote, “Do not be conformed 
to this world, but be transformed by the 
renewal of your mind, that you may 
prove what is the will of God, what is 
good, and acceptable and per-
fect.”  (Romans 12:2) 
     Whatever your passion is, may it 
become a resolution that will be guided 
by God.  Prayerfully remember, as you 
make your New Year’s Resolutions, “I 
cannot do everything, but I can do 
something. What can I do, Lord?” 
Happy New Year and blessed be your 
resolutions! 
 

 
Hot Teas & Salads 

By Denise Rapp 
 

     Here we go, another year gone. 
"What does this mean?"  It means we 
have a new mental fresh start!  
     Out with the old and in with the 
new. We can cleanse or minds, and 
bodies, of anything negative from the 
years past.  We look forward to new 
beginnings.  
     A few ways we can cleanse our bod-
ies, and maintain a high energy level, is 
by eating the right foods.  We can exer-
cise and cleanse our body of toxins. 
     Specific detox teas offer certain 
benefits. Herbs like lemongrass, ginger, 
dandelion, and milk thistle all contain 
properties which support a healthy 
liver.  Herbs help your liver begin a 
natural detoxifying process.  
     Ginger has been proven to alleviate 
oxidative stress within the liver.  This 
means ginger helps the liver perform its 
cleaning task more efficiently. Ginger 
tea has lots of antioxidants! Antioxi-
dants boost cell defense.  Ginger tea 
makes your immune system stronger 
and healthier.  
     Something else that makes your im-
mune system stronger and healthier are 
leafy vegetables and proteins in fish, 
chicken & quinoa.   
     If you will try to fit a few changes, 
along with a brisk daily walk, at least 
your body and mental state will im-
prove.   

     This month, I am giving you a few 
salad ideas to incorporate into your 
weekly food plan.  
     I always start my salad base with a 
mix of spring greens, baby spinach, 
shaved red cabbage & shredded car-
rots.  This is the base for every salad. 
All dressings should be served on the 
side for dipping.   No more drowning 
salads in dressing!!!!! That is how you 
eat salad. Plus, a bit of fresh cracked 
pepper goes along way, I'm just 
sayin..... 
 

Niscoise Salad: 
     Grilled salmon or tuna, (add Cajun 
spice to fish while preparing, to give an 
extra boost of flavor) hard boiled eggs, 
olives, steamed red potatoes & green 
beans. Finish with a squeeze of fresh 
lemon juice and the cracked pepper. 
 

Blackened Chicken Salad: 
     Dust chicken with generous 
amounts and Cajun spice, sauté in a hot 
skillet. Add diced tomatoes and avoca-
dos. Serve w/ Parmesan peppercorn 
dressing, on the side.  
 

Berry, Avocado & Quinoa Salad: 
     Cook quinoa per box directions. 
Start this salad with a bed of fresh baby 
spinach, add: raspberries, avocados, 
sliced almonds, blueberries, quinoa.  
Serve with Poppyseed dressing, on the 
side. 
      
     I hope these yummy salad inspira-
tions help. 
 
Enjoy! 
Denise Rapp 
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scripture, were not to make a New 
Year’s resolution per se, but to change 
my approach toward making them. The 
most important question I had was, 
“What can be done to help preserve 
God’s creation?” which includes you 
and me as well as our planet Earth.   
The motto of the Daughter’s of the 
King, a faith-based Episcopal women’s 
group, seems to hold the answer. For 
His sake… “I am but one, but I am one. 
I cannot do everything, but I can do 
something. What I can do, I ought to 
do.  What I ought to do, by the grace of 
God, I will do.  Lord, what will you 
have me do? Amen.” 
     This beautiful and simple prayer 
says it all.  “I cannot do everything, but 
I can do something.” And the vital 
question, “Lord, what will you have me 
do?” This  gives our resolution depth—
a faith based approach to making New 
Year’s resolutions! 
     As Christians who care about one 
another, we are often placed in difficult 
situations. Sometimes the only avenue 
left to take when trying to make a dif-
ference in ending war or helping others 
understand the drastic environmental 
changes ahead is through prayer and 
writing. 
     Always, there have been environ-
mentally friendly people. “Already the 
planet is so damaged and the future is 
so challenged by its rising human popu-
lation that the terms of survival will be 
severe beyond anything we have 
known in the past,” writes Thomas 
Berry, ordained Roman Catholic priest, 
historian and author of “The Dream of 
the Earth,” 1988. 

     Fifty-seven years ago, Albert Ein-
stein said, “We shall require a substan-
tially new manner of thinking if man-
kind is to survive.” Two thousand years 
ago, Paul wrote, “Do not be conformed 
to this world, but be transformed by the 
renewal of your mind, that you may 
prove what is the will of God, what is 
good, and acceptable and per-
fect.”  (Romans 12:2) 
     Whatever your passion is, may it 
become a resolution that will be guided 
by God.  Prayerfully remember, as you 
make your New Year’s Resolutions, “I 
cannot do everything, but I can do 
something. What can I do, Lord?” 
Happy New Year and blessed be your 
resolutions! 
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     Here we go, another year gone. 
"What does this mean?"  It means we 
have a new mental fresh start!  
     Out with the old and in with the 
new. We can cleanse or minds, and 
bodies, of anything negative from the 
years past.  We look forward to new 
beginnings.  
     A few ways we can cleanse our bod-
ies, and maintain a high energy level, is 
by eating the right foods.  We can exer-
cise and cleanse our body of toxins. 
     Specific detox teas offer certain 
benefits. Herbs like lemongrass, ginger, 
dandelion, and milk thistle all contain 
properties which support a healthy 
liver.  Herbs help your liver begin a 
natural detoxifying process.  
     Ginger has been proven to alleviate 
oxidative stress within the liver.  This 
means ginger helps the liver perform its 
cleaning task more efficiently. Ginger 
tea has lots of antioxidants! Antioxi-
dants boost cell defense.  Ginger tea 
makes your immune system stronger 
and healthier.  
     Something else that makes your im-
mune system stronger and healthier are 
leafy vegetables and proteins in fish, 
chicken & quinoa.   
     If you will try to fit a few changes, 
along with a brisk daily walk, at least 
your body and mental state will im-
prove.   

     This month, I am giving you a few 
salad ideas to incorporate into your 
weekly food plan.  
     I always start my salad base with a 
mix of spring greens, baby spinach, 
shaved red cabbage & shredded car-
rots.  This is the base for every salad. 
All dressings should be served on the 
side for dipping.   No more drowning 
salads in dressing!!!!! That is how you 
eat salad. Plus, a bit of fresh cracked 
pepper goes along way, I'm just 
sayin..... 
 

Niscoise Salad: 
     Grilled salmon or tuna, (add Cajun 
spice to fish while preparing, to give an 
extra boost of flavor) hard boiled eggs, 
olives, steamed red potatoes & green 
beans. Finish with a squeeze of fresh 
lemon juice and the cracked pepper. 
 

Blackened Chicken Salad: 
     Dust chicken with generous 
amounts and Cajun spice, sauté in a hot 
skillet. Add diced tomatoes and avoca-
dos. Serve w/ Parmesan peppercorn 
dressing, on the side.  
 

Berry, Avocado & Quinoa Salad: 
     Cook quinoa per box directions. 
Start this salad with a bed of fresh baby 
spinach, add: raspberries, avocados, 
sliced almonds, blueberries, quinoa.  
Serve with Poppyseed dressing, on the 
side. 
      
     I hope these yummy salad inspira-
tions help. 
 
Enjoy! 
Denise Rapp 
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emitted by vehicles.
 I have noticed that the industrial 
chemicals locally are often released at 
night or early morning.  If you enjoy 
viewing the major constellations which 
one can see even with all the street and 
outdoor residential lights, breathing PM 
dampens your love of star gazing; as 
well as dampening your desire to ride 
a bike in the early dawn when traffic is 
not heavy and carbon dioxide is light.  
The hazardous polluted industrial 
atmosphere is just waiting for that deep 
breathing you do when exercising, 
instead!
 It has been many years since EPA has 
monitored the quality of Mt. Vernon’s 
air.  To notify them of any concerns you 
have, send a comment via:  www.epa.
gov.tips
 Also, Indiana Department of 
Environmental Management does not 
even list Mt. Vernon on their charts.  
You can send a comment about our air 
quality via email to: JPARKS@idem.
in.gov  Some of you have stories to tell 
about the health of your child or another 
family member.  Please tell them.
 I believe it is a human right to have 
clean air to breathe.  An endangered 
atmosphere will remain and become 
worse as long as there is placid 
indifference.  Sending a note of concern 
or telling your story to IDEM and EPA 
is a beginning.  Martin Luther King, Jr. 
said, “The arc of the moral universe is 
long, but it bends towards justice.”  If we 
do not support the arc, how will it bend 
towards justice in our own time?

p l a n e t p r a y e r s @ g m a i l . c o m                      
copyright  Ann Rains  March 2018

CORRECTION TO THE APRIL 
EDITION OF THE NEW 
HARMONY GAZETTE!

by: Dan Barton, Publisher

 Just shortly after releasing the April 
edition of the Gazette a couple of errors 
were found in the article titled, “New 
Harmony Town Council - School 
Property Center Stage!”   
 The piece misstated that Architect 
Kennedy Hutson received $55,000 in 
compensation from the Town of New 
Harmony for preparing an architectural 
rendering of three development schemes 
for the former New Harmony School 
property.
 The amount reported was incorrect.  
After a review of the data used to prepare 
the article it was found the $55,000 was 
actually a bid rejection by the Town on 
another contractor who was interested 
in the job.     A few days after our paper 
was released, former Councilman 
Andrew Wilson also found the error 
and notified the New Harmony Gazette 
by email.   Mr. Wilson also stated that 
Hutson’s compensation was barely 
$10,000.  I can’t confirm that number 
but Wilson could have first hand 
knowledge of the payment since he had 
shared a partnership with Hutson in a 
New Harmony Real Estate Development 
LLC.   Wilson was also a New Harmony 
Town Councilman.    
 The second clarification to the story 
is that the payment to Mr. Hutson was 
made in 2013 and not by the current 
Town Council.   The April story 
inadvertently made it sound like the 
payment was paid by the Council we 
now have in office.   Thanks Andrew for 
notifying the Gazette of your concerns 

and apologies to the current Council for 
the confusion. 

FRENCH LEMON TART
by: Denise Rapp

I went to a friends house for a dinner 
party and she had made this incredible 
Lemon Tart for dessert. Oh my... I’m 
telling ya, I was in love. It has this crisp 
walnut Shortbread crust, zippy Lemon 
filling and a kaleidoscope of fresh fruit 
on top. Absolutely Delis!
This gorgeous dessert just screams 
Summer Time! 

French Lemon Tart - Serves 12

Crust:
1 c. Flour
1/2 c. Butter
1/4c. Brown Sugar
1/4 c. Rolled Oats
1/4 c. Walnuts (crushed)

Filling:
14oz. Can Condensed milk
1/4 c. Lemon juice 
1 tsp. Vanilla
1/2 c. Sour cream
Fresh fruit - like (berries, kiwi, mandarin 
oranges)

Combine the flour, butter & walnuts 
Press down tightly in a removable 
bottom Tart pan 
Prick w/ a fork 
Bake 10-15 minutes until it’s browned 
375
Let crust cool
Mix condensed milk, lemon juice, sour 
cream & vanilla
Pour into the shell
Slice berries and fruit and arrange theme 
in a pretty pattern on top
Refrigerate for several hours
Enjoy!

Contributing Writers
Dan Barton
Ann Rains

Denise Rapp
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scripture, were not to make a New 
Year’s resolution per se, but to change 
my approach toward making them. The 
most important question I had was, 
“What can be done to help preserve 
God’s creation?” which includes you 
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The motto of the Daughter’s of the 
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understand the drastic environmental 
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writing. 
     Always, there have been environ-
mentally friendly people. “Already the 
planet is so damaged and the future is 
so challenged by its rising human popu-
lation that the terms of survival will be 
severe beyond anything we have 
known in the past,” writes Thomas 
Berry, ordained Roman Catholic priest, 
historian and author of “The Dream of 
the Earth,” 1988. 

     Fifty-seven years ago, Albert Ein-
stein said, “We shall require a substan-
tially new manner of thinking if man-
kind is to survive.” Two thousand years 
ago, Paul wrote, “Do not be conformed 
to this world, but be transformed by the 
renewal of your mind, that you may 
prove what is the will of God, what is 
good, and acceptable and per-
fect.”  (Romans 12:2) 
     Whatever your passion is, may it 
become a resolution that will be guided 
by God.  Prayerfully remember, as you 
make your New Year’s Resolutions, “I 
cannot do everything, but I can do 
something. What can I do, Lord?” 
Happy New Year and blessed be your 
resolutions! 
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beginnings.  
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ies, and maintain a high energy level, is 
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cise and cleanse our body of toxins. 
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liver.  Herbs help your liver begin a 
natural detoxifying process.  
     Ginger has been proven to alleviate 
oxidative stress within the liver.  This 
means ginger helps the liver perform its 
cleaning task more efficiently. Ginger 
tea has lots of antioxidants! Antioxi-
dants boost cell defense.  Ginger tea 
makes your immune system stronger 
and healthier.  
     Something else that makes your im-
mune system stronger and healthier are 
leafy vegetables and proteins in fish, 
chicken & quinoa.   
     If you will try to fit a few changes, 
along with a brisk daily walk, at least 
your body and mental state will im-
prove.   

     This month, I am giving you a few 
salad ideas to incorporate into your 
weekly food plan.  
     I always start my salad base with a 
mix of spring greens, baby spinach, 
shaved red cabbage & shredded car-
rots.  This is the base for every salad. 
All dressings should be served on the 
side for dipping.   No more drowning 
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