



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
Board of Public Safety
Civic Center Complex, Room 301
Evansville, IN 47708
812.436.7897

MINUTES

Wednesday, June 28th, 2017

Building Commission – Ron Beane
Transportation & Services – Todd Robertson

Police Department – Chief Billy Bolin
Fire Department – Chief Mike Connelly

~ Pledge of Allegiance ~

Business with Representatives:

Departmental Reports:

A. Police Department – Captain Stephanie Cox

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Request approval to surplus 7 filing cabinets from our Records Department. The filing cabinets are no longer needed as we continue to scan documents to electronic format.

B. Fire Department – Battalion Chief Charles Hertzberger

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Request approval to advertise “Request for Proposal” to purchase and install vehicle exhaust capture systems in all fire stations and maintenance facility in accordance with Assistance to Firefighters Grant program award EMW-2016-FO-02831.

Michael Retter, President
Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
Kayce Zeller, Member
Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney

Board of Public Safety
Evansville, Indiana



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
 Board of Public Safety
 Civic Center Complex, Room 301
 Evansville, IN 47708
 812.436.7897

C. Building Commission – June Maples

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve to open bids for the following.
 Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve to award bids for the following.

1. Request approval to open and award bid s for the following:
 - a. 2120 WEST DELAWARE STREET - RAZE (DEMOLISH) HOUSE
 - b. 2122 WEST DELAWARE STREET - RAZE (DEMOLISH) HOUSE GARAGE AND SHED
 - c. 413 SOUTH LINWOOD AVENUE - RAZE (DEMOLISH) FIRE DAMAGED HOUSE AND SHED, REMOVE PRIVACY FENCE AND LOW WALL IN FRONT
 - d. 707 NORTH FIFTH AVENUE - RAZE (DEMOLISH) HOUSE
 - e. 521 GARFIELD AVENUE - RAZE (DEMOLISH) FIRE DAMAGED, HOUSE, GARAGE AND REMOVE NORTH, SOUTH AND WEST SIDE FENCES
 - f. 103 EAST TENNESSEE STREET - RAZE (DEMOLISH) FIRE DAMAGED, HOUSE AND REMOVE SOUTH, EAST AND WEST SIDE FENCES
 - g. 511 SOUTH DENBY AVENUE - RAZE (DEMOLISH) HOUSE AND REMOVE BLOCK WALL AND CONCRETE PAD

Property Location	VELPEN	ORISKY	STEMALY
2120 West Delaware St. – House	NO BID	5932	5726
2122 West Delaware St. –House, Garage and Shed	11500	7274.30	7126
413 South Linwood Ave – Fire Damaged House, Garage and Remove North, South and West Side Fences	No Bid	No Bid	6868
707 North Fifth Ave – House	5700	5813.50	6320
521 Garfield Ave – Fire Damaged House, Garage	7900	7502	6177

Michael Retter, President
 Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
 Kayce Zeller, Member
 Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
 Board of Public Safety
 Civic Center Complex, Room 301
 Evansville, IN 47708
 812.436.7897

and Remove North, South and West Side Fences			
103 East Tennessee St – Fire Damaged House and Remove the South, East and West Side Fences	8200	10310.30	6675
511 South Denby Ave – House and Remove Block Wall and Concrete Pad	No Bid	9400	6096

D. Transportation & Services – Todd Robertson

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Request approval for the following items:
 - a. Install “Yield to METS Buses” & “No Passing” signs at Stahl Road between Epworth Road and Beachfront Driver. METS Transportation buses are having an issue with vehicles passing them in blind spots.
 - b. Install “End of the Road” diamond markers at 2701 Margybeth Ave.

E. Special Event Permit – Sgt. Josh Wittmer

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. AIDS Resource Group requests approval “2017 Southwest Indiana AIDS Walk” on September 16th, 2017 from 9:00 a.m. to 3:30 p.m. Route will begin at 501 Court Street going north on NW 5th Street, turning right onto Vine Street, turning right onto NW 2nd Street, turning right onto Court Street. All participants will be using the sidewalks during this walk.

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

2. Evansville Sports Corporation requests approval for the “Riverside Relay Marathon” on September 19th, 2017 from 7:00 p.m. to 11:59 p.m. Closing Riverside Drive from Court to

Michael Retter, President
 Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
 Kayce Zeller, Member
 Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
Board of Public Safety
Civic Center Complex, Room 301
Evansville, IN 47708
812.436.7897

Cherry Street; Closing Main Street from Riverside Drive to NW 1st Street; Closing Locust Street from Riverside Drive to NW 1st Street. *****BARRICADES REQUESTED*****

Consent Section:

A. Lane Restriction

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Hydromax Plumbing, Inc requests approval to restrict a lane at 1167 Parrett Street on August 24th, 2017 from 8:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. to install a server tap.

B. Dumpster Permit

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Jace Rogers Realtor Inc & Fulton LLC request a dumpster permit for 210 North Fulton Ave at the front door while the parking lot is being asphalted from June 28th, 2017 to July 28th, 2017. (30 yard dumpster)

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

2. Notify board that Brandi Macer received a dumpster permit for 1654 S. Kerth Ave from June 23rd, 2017 to July 2nd, 2017. Permit was approved due to a court action the following Monday, July 3rd, 2017. (Landlord stated the dumpster permit was needed on June 23rd, 2017 due to a court date on Monday, July 3rd with the previous renter. 1 dumpster – 2 parking spaces)

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

3. Danny Fulton, Fulton Tiles LLC, & DKF Holdings requests a dumpster permit for 18-20 NW Sixth Street on July 1st, 2017 through December 1st, 2017 due to remodeling of a condominium on the second floor and demolition construction on the first floor. From the second floor to the first floor there will be an outside trash shoot made out of plywood, this will allow foot traffic to be less interrupted and to be more safe.(1 dumpster – 2 parking spaces)

Michael Retter, President
Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
Kayce Zeller, Member
Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
Board of Public Safety
Civic Center Complex, Room 301
Evansville, IN 47708
812.436.7897

C. Taxi Cab Driver Permits

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Request approval for the following taxi cab permits:
 - a. Bart James Stinson
 - b. Roger Dale Hayes

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to table the following:

- c. Michael Hutchcraft

D. Road Closure

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Ubelhor Tree Service requests approval to close the road at 206 Oak Street on July 5th, 2017 & July 6th, 2017 from 8:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. both days to cut down a tree and process the tree. The road will be open every evening for traffic.

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

2. Franklin Street Tavern requests approval to close 11th Ave from Franklin Street to Illinois Street on July 21st, 2017 7:00 a.m. until midnight on July 22nd, 2017 for two charity events, Friday for Tristate for Troops and Saturday for Granted Children's Charity.

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

3. Liberty Baptist Church requests approval to close the 700 block of Oak Street between 8th Street and Martin Luther King Jr. Blvd. on July 21st, 2017 from 5 p.m. to 9 p.m. for Vacation Bible School Fun Day Celebration.

Michael Retter, President
Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
Kayce Zeller, Member
Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney



CITY OF EVANSVILLE
Board of Public Safety
Civic Center Complex, Room 301
Evansville, IN 47708
812.436.7897

E. Parking Permit

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following for a temporary parking permit until July 12th, 2017 meeting to approve a permanent one:

1. Request approval for the following parking permit:
 - a. Brian L. Hite June 19th, 2017 to June 19th, 2018
1991 Tilt Trailer – Blue
Plate # TR395HUB
No logo – 2114 W. Virginia

OTHER BUSINESS:

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

1. Approve claims.

Motion by Mike Lauderdale, 2nd by Kayce Zeller and so ordered to approve the following:

2. Approve the minutes from Wednesday, June 14th, 2017

Announcements:

Next Meeting, July 12th, 2017 at 1:00 p.m.

Adjourned: 1:25 ML/KZ

Michael Retter, President
Mike Lauderdale, Vice President
Kayce Zeller, Member
Clay Havill, Counsel Attorney